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APPROACHING HOLINESS
Exploring the History and Teachings of the Old TestamentExploring the History and Teachings of the Old Testament

NEW FROM THE RELIGIOUS STUDIES CENTER

Provo, Utah, and Salt Lake City—

Approaching Holiness aims to assist in 

the personal and family study of the 

history and teachings of the Old Tes-

tament. Not only is the Old Testament 

foundational to our understanding 

of the birth, life, atonement, crucifix-

ion, and resurrection of the Savior, as 

found in the New Testament, the Book 

of Mormon, and other scripture, but 

it also teaches us about God, our faith 

history, and the spiritual heritage of 

the house of Israel.

The Old Testament introduces us 

to the character and purposes of God. 

We are taught about the creation of 

the world and humanity, the Fall of 

Adam and Eve and the entrance of 

sin into the world, the role of prophets 

and the priesthood, the expectations 

accompanying kingship, and the pun-

ishments and blessings of the laws and 

covenants of God. God is revealed to 

be one who protects, provides, rescues, 

and guides but also one who corrects, 

punishes, chastises, and forgives.

This book is a sampling from the 

vast archives of the Religious Studies 

Center, written by experts and other 

professionals from BYU, BYU–Hawaii, 

the John A. Widtsoe Foundation, and 

Saint John’s University. The collec-

tion represents some of the center’s 

most frequently utilized publications, 

selected to represent the earlier tes-

tament, or covenant, along with key 

episodes in the biblical history of the 

ancient Near East.

Approaching Holiness: Exploring Exploring 

the History and Teachings of the Old the History and Teachings of the Old 

TestamentTestament was edited by Krystal V. L. 

Pierce and David Rolph Seely and 

copublished by the Religious Studies 

Center at Brigham Young University 

and Deseret Book. Visit rsc.byu.edu 

/book/approaching-holiness for more 

information.

DETAILS
Purchase at Deseret Book or online at  

deseretbook.com
Hardcover $29.99

Pages: 404

Size: 6" x 9"

ISBN: 978-1-9503-0420-2

Published: RSC and Deseret Book, 2021

CONNECT WITH US      rsc.byu.edu

ABOUT THE EDITORS

KRYSTAL V. L. PIERCE is an assistant pro-
fessor in the Department of Ancient Scrip-
ture at Brigham Young University, where 
she teaches classes on the Bible and Book 
of Mormon. She has also taught classes on 
Egyptology at the BYU Jerusalem Center 
for Near Eastern Studies. She received a 
PhD in Egyptian archaeology and Near 
Eastern languages and cultures from UCLA 
and an MA and BA in Near Eastern studies 
from UC Berkeley. She has excavated at 
several sites in Egypt and Israel and is cur-
rently the head registrar at the Tel Shim-
ron Excavations in Israel and chair of the 
Archaeology of Egypt session at ASOR.

DAVID ROLPH SEELY has graduate 
degrees from Brigham Young University in 
classics and from the University of Michi-
gan in ancient and biblical studies. He is a 
professor of ancient scripture at Brigham 
Young University, where he teaches 
courses on Book of Mormon, Old and New 
Testament, and ancient Near Eastern stud-
ies. He is a member of the international 
team of scholars that translated and pub-
lished the Dead Sea Scrolls and published 
together with Professor Moshe Weinfeld 
the Barkhi Nafshi hymns from Qumran.
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